
COPYRIGHT DISCLAIMER 

 

Welcome to the official website of 123 Whi�ng Marke�ng Company LLC. The following disclaimer 
governs your use of this website. By accessing and using this website, you acknowledge that you have 
read, understood, and agree to comply with the terms and condi�ons stated below. 

 

1. Ownership of Content:  

All content, including but not limited to text, images, graphics, logos, videos, and audio files, displayed 
on this website is the property of 123 Whi�ng Marke�ng Company LLC, its affiliates, or third-party 
licensors, and is protected by applicable copyright laws. Unauthorized use or reproduc�on of this 
content may violate copyright laws and result in legal consequences. 

 

2. Permited Use: 

You are granted a limited, non-exclusive, and revocable license to access and view the content on this 
website for personal, non-commercial use only. You may not modify, distribute, transmit, display, 
perform, reproduce, publish, license, create deriva�ve works from, transfer, or sell any informa�on, 
so�ware, products, or services obtained from this website. 

 

3. Trademarks: 

All trademarks, service marks, trade names, and logos displayed on this website are the property of 123 
Whi�ng Marke�ng Company LLC, its affiliates, or third-party licensors. Use of these trademarks without 
the prior writen consent of 123 Whi�ng Marke�ng Company LLC or its respec�ve owners is strictly 
prohibited. 

 

4. Third-Party Content: 

This website may contain links to third-party websites or include content provided by third par�es. Such 
third-party content is the sole responsibility of the respec�ve owners, and 123 Whi�ng Marke�ng 
Company LLC does not endorse or guarantee the accuracy, completeness, or reliability of such content. 
Accessing third-party websites through links on this website is done at your own risk. 

 

5. Copyright Infringement Claims: 

If you believe that any content on this website infringes upon your copyright or the copyright of others, 
please contact us at [insert contact informa�on] with the following informa�on: (a) a descrip�on of the 
copyrighted work claimed to have been infringed; (b) iden�fica�on of the allegedly infringing material; 
(c) your contact informa�on; and (d) a statement declaring that you have a good-faith belief that the use 
of the material is not authorized by the copyright owner, its agent, or the law. 

 

6. Disclaimer of Liability: 

While we strive to provide accurate and up-to-date informa�on on this website, 123 Whi�ng Marke�ng 
Company LLC makes no warran�es or representa�ons, express or implied, regarding the accuracy, 
completeness, reliability, or suitability of the informa�on and materials provided. Your use of this 
website is at your own risk. 

 

7. Modifica�on of Disclaimer: 

123 Whi�ng Marke�ng Company LLC reserves the right to modify, update, or remove sec�ons of this 
copyright disclaimer at any �me without prior no�ce. Your con�nued use of this website a�er any 
changes indicates your acceptance of the modified terms and condi�ons. 

 

For any ques�ons or concerns regarding this copyright disclaimer, please contact us at [insert contact 
informa�on]. 

 

--- 



 

Please note that this is a general copyright disclaimer, and it's always a good idea to consult with a legal 
professional to ensure that it meets the specific requirements of your business and jurisdic�on. 


